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Note: All questions are compulsory. The Marks allotted for each question are given
beside the questions.
(i) ST IRETHT F TIH TS TT FAL 00 AL AT, ATHIRA T, TLTTT g H ATH
A fauT =y orsat ¥ forfer)
Write your name, enrollment numbers, Al name and subject on the first page
of the answer sheet.

Q.1 Fafefaa & 9 B ©F w1 #1398 S99 40-60 srsat § ST 2
Answer any one of the following questions in about 40- 60 words.
(a) HHTST § U AFT3eE T IHFHT TTY F) (U735 1 39)
Explain the role of an accountant in the society. (See Lesson 1)
b) T SATTATAF oh HIH & FIF ATRUI & &F-' TH HAT & AATH | T&T AT
ATLTIOTT T T 3T Hged AT (IS 2 T9)

‘All business transactions must be in terms of money.’ In the light of this statement
explain the meaning and significance of money measurement concept. (See Lesson 2)

Q2 . Rwforfera o & fareft U= wor T ¥ <9I 40-60 oreai § <o) 2
Answer any one of the following questions in about 40- 60 words.
a) @IE e TF oY Toq Ned gF & d1= a2 aar| T TEdhi w1 IT=T 912 7|
(ITS 8 T@)
Differentiate between Purchase Returns Book and Sales Return Book. Draw the
format of both the books. (See Lesson 8)

b) 'TAIE T THATT @TAT =T LEAT & HorTe: AT 981 g')| fevuoft Fifsm)
(IT5 9 TW)
‘Agreement of Trial Balance is not the conclusive proof of the accuracy of accounts’.
Comment, (See Lesson 9)



Q3 . Fferfera o T BT U wor &7 39 AT 40-60 9Tt § AfS0) 2
Answer any one of the following questions in about 40-60 words.
a) o<t ot it T fore wearre & At fEaeont & oo it 9 a9 STt 82
(I3 31 TF)

How do limitations of financial statements become limitation of analysis of financial

statements. (See Lesson 31)

b) fare g Fit FEfEtE F aviE i) (IS 35 @)

Explain the procedure of preparation of Reports using Pivot Table. (See Lesson 35)

Q4. Frferfaa & & faefy uar wor =71 3¢ Avraer -100150 9rsat & <ol 4
Answer any one of the following questions in about 100 -150 words.
a) TR 3 397 &1 9T §. off Fou fi IF TG A EaE | 71 THady
2023 = form 3
IGIRREEEURSIENEY)
2023
SHERt 01 9 A7 32,500
SEELT 01 Tehe AT 12,300
SEELT 03 = T |1 &0 %7 5,300
AT 08 THE | AT &7 f&37 9,500
STHAT 10 = T Te9Tse? &1 %7 5,400
AT 15 7T T & 7 =k 91| B 7,900
R EIEEIRERD)
AR 17 =9 g0 T 7 9 1,000
SEELT 20 TS S § AT 10,000
STHET 22 AT FT A 500
SHAT 24 qiad & 9% @47 7,000
STHA<T 28 = FIT R &7 sEraT 3,000
STHA<T 30 AT FHT AT 3,500 (ITS 7 3@)

Record the following transactions in the Bank column Cash Book of M/s Shree
Krishna for the month of January 2023.

Date Details (Rs.)

2023

January 01 Bank Balance
32,500

January 01 Cash Balance

12,300



January 03 Purchased
5,300

January 08 Goods
9,500

January 10 Purchased
5,400

January 15 Sold Goods
7,900 (deposited on the same day)
January 17 Purchased
1,000

January 20 Cash
10,000

January 22

500

January 24 Cheque
7,000

January 28 Rent
3,000

January 30

3,500

Goods

Sold

Typewriter

and

Stationery

deposited

Paid

given

paid

Paid

b) 2500 F 200 T F % e & At o= aw gfEfeEt fifsm:

() 500 9% FATH 2500 T oTTe
(i) %450 9T FATEE 3500 UT ove
(i) 550 9% A9 2500 T omver
(iv) 500 9% AT9T 2550 TT o
(v) 450 9% AT 3550 T o

Make journal entries if 200, 9% debentures of X 500 each have been issued as:

(1) Issued at % 500, redeemable at T 500
(i) Issue at % 450; redeemable at T 500

(i)  Issued at X 550; redeemable at T 500
(iv)  Issued at X 500; redeemable at X 550
v) Issued at X 450; redeemable at X 550

by cheque
for cash
by Cheque
received Cheque
by Cheque
into bank
Cartage
to Mudit
by Cheque
Salary
(See Lesson 7)
(IT3 30 TW)
(See Lesson 30)
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Q5. Fferfaa & & ey us wor =1 3¢ avraer 100150 9rsat & <ol
Answer any one of the following questions in about 100 -150 words.

a) TH 3T FFHAT TG 1, 2006 FT 21,00,000 T =T YT F FT SATITLAEH FLd
21 a9 & I AT FHAT: X 1, ¥ 0002 T A8 SO0TETISMLOT U TS HHA:

2200 T 2100 g1 TAFT USIT U 8%ATHF 4TS (&AT SATAT 1 F9F HT 32,000 T 718
Faq 3T AT § F AT Aq9 & gge 394,000 FT ATH FOIT FA A ATH FT
FEATIT 2: | FHAATT § Fd 19TH T g S HTIe @rar i 9rerem & 91 °rd

TAT

(U135 22 =)



Naman and Asmeta started business with capital of ¥ 1,00,000 each on January
1,2023. their drawings during the year were T 1,000 and % 500 per month respectively.
The interest on drawing was Z 200 and X 100 respectively. They are allowed interest
on capital at 8% p.a. Naman is allowed a salary of ¥ 2,000 per month. They earned a
profit of X 94,000 before interest and salary. They share profit is the ratio of 2.1.
Prepare Profit and Loss Appropriation Account for the year ended March 31, 2013
and Capital accounts of partners. (See Lesson 22)

b) o= "rar-fuar & fBfes corft geofEy s& &4, T, e, seeante fi

LA i A TR ITehT Sad Tate & q7F Teoi® GEil IO a9 il graahl
TTf9r AT FAAN (U735 14 T9)

Ask your parents about the date of various fixed assets purchased by them like T.V.,
Fridge, Motorcycle, Car etc., with its useful life and then calculate the amount of
depreciation to be charged on each asset. (See Lesson 14)

Q.6 == & T TRATSATA | | FlE T TRATSHAT T HIT) 6
Prepare any one project out of the given below:
a) T Td ¢ T =aamdY 7" §% @1d &7 ereae (update); F09 & fordd= & Sma 2
freft off o & S0 quT S ST & ST ITH T ARl o qrae | qrrerd:
Toi T 8 Tuar ST SAETdardl F Afverad fhaT g srurar Jat AT 812
T it U EIGATOT ST TT 376 9o T 9T TG HT 290754
(U135 10 =)
You know that businessman generally visit their banks to get updated position
regarding their bank account. Visit any bank and enquire from the bank officer what
discrepencies generally they notice in the items. They have recorded or not recorded

the items or not recorded by their customers. Make a list of the discrepencies and
show the effect on the bank balance.

S.No Reason of discrepency/actual Effect on account
Effect on account difference
in the bank balance and the | Plus Minus
balance expected by the
customer.

(See Lesson -10)
b) 3o AfraTaE® AE™T F [T AT AT AF/FAT F forw oy e sy &
Fg g9d Fd 2| e i 72 it a=at i g a9 IEE FIOT 99T /9T Y
ITELT % HgTal & AT U2 390 A=a¥ F, [oad & o= g qragm oTeai
T T AT & Tohl (ITS 15 =)




Your parents from their regular income make some savings for the known or unknown
expenses/liability to meet out in future. Prepare a list of past three months savings
with reasons and differentiate them in reserves or provisions keeping in view the
principles of the same. (See Lesson 15)



